
to Catholic Social Teaching for it is closely linked to human dignity. Based on this dignity, 
workers have a legitimate claim to those essential material goods that meet basic needs for food, 
clothing, shelter, health, education, security, and rest. Pope Leo XIII, in his Encyclical “Rerum 
Novarum”, asserts that justice, rooted in human dignity, meant that a just wage is one that allows 
a worker and family to live in “reasonable and frugal comfort” (#34). St. John Paul II, in his 
encyclical “Centesimus Annus”, considers a just wage as a “legitimate fruit of work” and to 
refuse or withhold it “can be a grave injustice” (#15). Pope Francis, for his part, emphasizes that 
a just wage should not be divorced from the workers demand for “three Ts”: Trabajo (work), 
Techo (housing), and Tierra (land and food). In the end, it is work that gives the human person 
dignity. 

The Urgency of Living Wage 
The Covid-19 pandemic and the war on Ukraine critically contributed to the worsening socio-
economic conditions of the working class. Record-high inflation rates (highest in 14 years) led to 
price spike of basic commodities. Recently, the Department of Agriculture announced a possible 
increase in retail prices of rice “by as much as P5/kilo in the coming weeks due to expensive 
fertilizer and other farm inputs.” Skyrocketing prices of food, transportation, energy, and services 
continue to widen the gap between the minimum wage and family living wage. According to 
research group IBON, raising the minimum wage is urgent because the current nominal 
minimum wage of Filipino workers is unable to keep up with rising cost of living. Rising 
inflation and price increase in food items push the family living wage nationwide to an average 
of P1,165. 

The rising cost of living and the insufficient wage are forcing workers to work more than twelve 
hours a day for an extra income to provide for their family. Others look for part-time jobs. 
Overworked and underpaid workers suffer from physical exhaustion which results to serious 
health problems including death. In November last year, Lalamove rider Noel Escote was found 
dead at his parked motorcycle in Kapitolyo, Pasig City. He died of fatigue after delivering goods 
to customers for almost twenty-four hours without rest. 

CWS strongly urges the Marcos Jr. administration to give serious attention to wages, income, 
and the dignity of work. The administration should back workers' demands for a national wage 
increase if it genuinely wishes to help millions of wage earners and their families in coping with 
rising prices. Pope John XXIII, in Mater et Magistra, affirmed that the remuneration of work can 
be left neither to “the laws of the market place” nor “the will of the more powerful” but “must be 
determined in accordance with justice and equity.”  In other words, it must permit workers “to 
live a truly human life and to fulfill their family obligations in a worthy manner.” 
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